



Option #3 Sticker Program- Bundles of E-Recyclables - Total Cost Per Item						10.75	10.75	10.75	10.75	10.75					
Option #3 Sticker Program-Single Small E-Recyclable items - # of Stickers Per Item						5	5	5	5	5					
Option #3 Sticker Program-Single Small E-Recyclable items - Total Cost Per Item						10.75	10.75	10.75	10.75	10.75					
2. Spring Clean Up - Annual Mobilization		150	156.75	163.8	171.17	178.88	75850	77746.25	79689.91	81682.15	83724.21				
2. Spring Clean Up - Per Ton Rate		52	54.34	56.79	59.34	62.01	62.5	64.06	65.66	67.31	68.99				
3. Special Waste Collection per yard		No Bid	Need	More	Info		14	14.5	15	15.5	16				
3. Special Waste Collection Per Haul		No Bid	Need	More	Info		400	412	424	437	450				
4. Hazardous Waste Collection per yard		No Bid	Need	More	Info		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
5. Dry Cell Battery Collection Per Unit (Advanced Per Month Rate)		No Bid	Need	More	Info		450	459	468.18	477.54	487.09				
6. Organic Composting with Yard Waste Per Unit		Accept	Accept	Accept	Accept	Accept	Accept	Accept	Accept	Accept	Accept				

**Voluntary Alterations**

**OPTION #3 -**

		Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 4	Year 5	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 4	Year 5	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 4	Year 5
Refuse/ Yardwaste Sticker							2.15	2.19	2.24	2.28	2.33					
Refuse/ Yardwaste Collection Monthly Access Fee							5.50	5.61	5.72	5.84	5.95					
Refuse/ Yardwaste SENIOR Sticker							2.15	2.19	2.24	2.25	2.33					
Refuse/ Yardwaste SENIOR Collection Monthly Access Fee							3.50	3.57	3.64	3.71	3.79					
35-Gallon Refuse Toter Monthly Rental							12.00	12.24	12.47	12.73	12.99					
35-Gallon Refuse Toter Monthly Access Fee							5.50	5.61	5.72	5.84	5.95					
35-Gallon Refuse SENIOR Toter Monthly Rental							8.50	8.67	8.84	9.02	9.20					
35-Gallon Refuse SENIOR Toter Monthly Access Fee							3.50	3.57	3.64	3.71	3.79					
65-Gallon Refuse Toter Monthly Rental							14.25	14.54	14.83	15.12	15.42					
65-Gallon Refuse Toter Monthly Access Fee							5.50	5.61	5.72	5.84	5.95					
95-Gallon Refuse Toter Monthly Rental							16.75	17.09	17.43	17.78	18.13					
95-Gallon Refuse Toter Monthly Access Fee							5.50	5.61	5.72	5.84	5.95					
Half Refuse Bag (20 gal.)							1.95	1.99	2.03	2.07	2.11					
Half Refuse Bag (20 gal.) - Monthly Access Fee							5.50	5.61	5.72	5.84	5.95					
Half Refuse Bag (20 gal.) SENIOR							1.95	1.99	2.03	2.07	2.11					
Half Refuse Bag (20 gal.) - SENIOR - Monthly Access Fee							3.50	3.57	3.64	3.71	3.79					
Standard 65-Gallon Recycling Toter																
35-Gallon Recycling Toter Monthly Rental (Optional Additional Toter)							1.20	1.22	1.25	1.27	1.30					
65-Gallon Recycling Toter Monthly Rental (Optional Additional Toter)							1.20	1.22	1.25	1.27	1.30					
95-Gallon Recycling Toter Monthly Rental (Optional Additional Toter)							1.20	1.22	1.25	1.27	1.30					
65-Gallon Yard Waste Toter Monthly Rental							19.00	19.38	19.77	20.16	20.57					
Extra Bulk or Refuse (Per Item)							1 Sticker	1 Sticker	1 Sticker	1 Sticker	1 Sticker					
Extra White Goods (Per Item)							25.00	25.50	26.01	26.53	27.06					
Disaster Disposal Transportation Residential Truck - Per Hour Per Unit							118.00	120.36	122.77	125.22	127.73					
Disaster Disposal Roll off Transportation - Per Unit							145.00	147.90	150.86	153.88	156.95					
Disaster Disposal for Residential and Roll off -Per Ton							52.00	53.04	54.10	55.18	56.29					
Disaster Disposal for Residential and Roll off - Alternative Per cubic yard							35.00	35.70	36.41	37.14	37.89					
STC Multi - Family > 6 units (Per Occupied Unit)							7.11	7.25	7.40	7.55	7.70					
STC Special Multi-Use rate (Per Cubic Yard)							3.50	3.57	3.64	3.71	3.79					